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From: Alvis, Brian (Federal)
To: Shawn Jensen
Cc: Marshall, Wilfred (Federal); Good, Stan (Federal); Garces, Nympha (Federal)
Subject: Fidelity Bonding Question - AltaSea at the Port of Los Angeles - EDA Award No. 07 01 07315
Date: Tuesday, March 7, 2017 4:32:49 PM
Attachments: FinancialAssistanceAward.pdf
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Shawn
 
I have done some research on the fidelity bonding issue.  The bonding requirement appears in 2 CFR
200.304, which is part of the Uniform Administrative Requirements, Cost Principals and Audit
Requirements as indicated on the lower half of your Financial Assistance Award document (CD-
450).  I have attached a copy of this document for your reference.
 
I have also attached a copy of the CFR for your reference.
 
Please call me if you have any questions.
 
Brian C. Alvis, P.E.
Civil Engineer
Economic Development Administration
915 Second Avenue – Room 1890
Seattle, WA 98174
Tel (206) 220-7688 | Fax (206) 220-7669
 
 
 
 


From: Shawn Jensen [mailto:sjensen@altasea.org] 
Sent: Friday, February 24, 2017 9:50 AM
To: Alvis, Brian (Federal) <BAlvis@eda.gov>
Cc: Marshall, Wilfred (Federal) <WMarshall@eda.gov>
Subject: RE: Guidance CD (Zipped Version 4.0) - AltaSea at the Port of Los Angeles - EDA Award No.
07 01 07315
 
Thank you Brian. Did you get any additional information regarding the bonding?
 
Best,
 
SHAWN JENSEN
Manager of Government Funding and Program Partnerships
AltaSea at the Port of Los Angeles
Direct: (424)210-4326     Main: (424)210-4320
222 West 6th Street, Suite 1010
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Award Document (Form CD450) signed by the Grants Officer constitutes an obligation of Federal funding.
By signing this Form CD450, the Recipient agrees to comply with the Award provisions checked below and attached. Upon



by the Recipient, the Form CD.450 must be signed by an authorized representative of the Recipient and returned to the
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tr
tr
tr
fl
tr
fl



DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE FINANCIAL ASSISTANCE STANDARD TERMS AND CONDITIONS (DEC. 2014)
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Need assistance?



 
 
ELECTRONIC CODE OF FEDERAL REGULATIONS



e­CFR data is current as of March 6, 2017



Title 2 → Subtitle A → Chapter II → Part 200 → Subpart D → §200.304



Title 2: Grants and Agreements  
PART 200—UNIFORM ADMINISTRATIVE REQUIREMENTS, COST PRINCIPLES, AND AUDIT REQUIREMENTS FOR
FEDERAL AWARDS  
Subpart D—Post Federal Award Requirements



§200.304   Bonds.



The Federal awarding agency may include a provision on bonding, insurance, or both in the following circumstances:



(a) Where the Federal Government guarantees or insures the repayment of money borrowed by the recipient, the
Federal awarding agency, at its discretion, may require adequate bonding and insurance if the bonding and insurance
requirements of the non­Federal entity are not deemed adequate to protect the interest of the Federal Government.



(b) The Federal awarding agency may require adequate fidelity bond coverage where the non­Federal entity lacks
sufficient coverage to protect the Federal Government's interest.



(c) Where bonds are required in the situations described above, the bonds must be obtained from companies holding
certificates of authority as acceptable sureties, as prescribed in 31 CFR Part 223, “Surety Companies Doing Business with
the United States.”
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San Pedro, CA 90731
sjensen@altasea.org
altasea.org
 


Donate now: The ocean is our future.
 
 


 


From: Alvis, Brian (Federal) [mailto:BAlvis@eda.gov] 
Sent: Thursday, February 23, 2017 2:12 PM
To: Shawn Jensen <sjensen@altasea.org>
Cc: Marshall, Wilfred (Federal) <WMarshall@eda.gov>
Subject: RE: Guidance CD (Zipped Version 4.0) - AltaSea at the Port of Los Angeles - EDA Award No.
07 01 07315
 
Great.  The only issue I know of is that the EDA Construction Sign has the previous president’s name
on it.  We are awaiting direction from our HQ folks on how the sign is supposed to change.
 
I’ll keep you posted on this issue…..
 


From: Shawn Jensen [mailto:sjensen@altasea.org] 
Sent: Thursday, February 23, 2017 2:09 PM
To: Alvis, Brian (Federal) <BAlvis@eda.gov>
Cc: Marshall, Wilfred (Federal) <WMarshall@eda.gov>
Subject: RE: Guidance CD (Zipped Version 4.0) - AltaSea at the Port of Los Angeles - EDA Award No.
07 01 07315
 
Hi Brian,
 
I had listened to your voicemail and just received this email. It appears all the files have made it to
me and I have them saved to my hard drive. I will begin to look through the files per your
instructions below and I will reach out with any questions.
 
Thank you,
 
SHAWN JENSEN
Manager of Government Funding and Program Partnerships
AltaSea at the Port of Los Angeles
Direct: (424)210-4326     Main: (424)210-4320
222 West 6th Street, Suite 1010
San Pedro, CA 90731
sjensen@altasea.org
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altasea.org
 


Donate now: The ocean is our future.
 
 


 


From: Alvis, Brian (Federal) [mailto:BAlvis@eda.gov] 
Sent: Thursday, February 23, 2017 2:01 PM
To: Shawn Jensen <sjensen@altasea.org>
Cc: Marshall, Wilfred (Federal) <WMarshall@eda.gov>
Subject: Guidance CD (Zipped Version 4.0) - AltaSea at the Port of Los Angeles - EDA Award No. 07
01 07315
 
Shawn
 
I am forwarding to your attention a compact disc with guidance information for use in administering
your EDA grant.  While this CD is intended for rather generic EDA-funded construction projects, you
will find that much of the guidance included herein will apply to your project.
 
Please “unzip” the attached file to a location on your hard-drive (or another location).  The total file
is approximately 21 MB when unzipped.  Then, please read the document “ABOUT K-PAI.pdf” in the
file labeled “7-ABOUT K-PAI” and proceed to the “Main Page.pdf”.
 
If you should have any questions, please call or email me.
 
Brian C. Alvis | Civil Engineer | Economic Development Administration | Tel (206) 220-7688 | Fax
(206) 220-7669
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